

R4-00333

Barry, Corrado & Grassi, P.C.

Attorneys at Law
2700 Pacific Avenue
Wildwood, NJ 08260
(809) 729-1333
www.capelegal.com

City of Ventnor
6201 Atlantic Avenue
Ventnor, NJ 08406

March 21, 2014

Inv #: 34390
File #: 6056-001

In reference to: Ventnor - Investigation of Latin Freestyle Beach Festival

DATE	ATTY	DESCRIPTION	HOURS	AMOUNT
09/25/2013	FLC	Telephone Conference with Weintrob, review contract, review emails and documents, ordinance	1.40	189.00
09/26/2013	FLC	Review documents, chronology, telephone conference with Mr. Benedetto and Ms. Weintrob	2.50	337.50
09/27/2013	FLC	Review file, telephone conference with Mr. Benedetto regarding appointments	0.80	108.00
09/30/2013	FLC	Telephone Conference with Benedetto, prepare for interviews	1.00	135.00
10/3/2013	FLC	Interview Groff and Haislip and memo	2.50	337.50
10/4/2013	FLC	Memorandum summarizing interview of Groff Haislip, email and telephone conference with Mr. Benedetto	2.00	270.00
10/7/2013	FLC	Telephone Conference with J. Thred / M. Soto regarding interview	0.40	54.00
10/8/2013	FLC	Telephone Conference with Ms. Weintrob regarding matter, email Vogel	0.50	67.50
10/9/2013	FLC	Review statements, telephone conference with Ms. Weintrob	0.50	67.50
10/11/2013	FLC	Interviews of Ventnor employees	7.50	1,012.50
10/14/2013	FLC	Interview summaries	2.50	337.50

10/15/2013	FLC	Interviews - Quirk and Biagi	2.50	337.50
	FLC	Interview summaries and chronology, document index	2.50	337.50
10/16/2013	FLC	Interview summaries	1.50	202.50
10/17/2013	FLC	Bagnell summary, email regarding lease/Vogel	0.50	67.50
10/21/2013	FLC	Interview summaries, draft report	2.00	270.00
10/24/2013	FLC	Draft interview summaries and report	1.00	135.00
10/25/2013	FLC	Draft interview summaries	1.00	135.00
10/28/2013	FLC	Draft report, interview summaries	1.00	135.00
10/29/2013	FLC	Report and interview summary	1.00	135.00
10/30/2013	FLC	Report and interview summaries	1.20	162.00
10/31/2013	FLC	Interview summaries	2.00	270.00
11/1/2013	FLC	Interview summaries and report	2.00	270.00
11/2/2013	FLC	Interview summaries	1.50	202.50
11/4/2013	FLC	Interview summaries and prepare report, Sarno, Colbrese, Haisert	2.00	270.00
11/5/2013	FLC	Interview summaries and outline report	3.80	513.00
11/6/2013	FLC	Investigation summaries and draft report	3.00	405.00
11/7/2013	FLC	Draft report, legal research	3.00	405.00
11/15/2013	FLC	Draft report	1.00	135.00
01/7/2014	FLC	Draft report	1.00	135.00

City of Ventnor

Invoice #: 34390

Page

01/9/2014	FLC	Draft report	1.00	135.00
01/10/2014	FLC	Draft report	2.50	337.50
01/12/2014	FLC	Draft report	2.00	270.00
01/13/2014	FLC	Draft report	4.50	607.50
01/24/2014	FLC	Draft report	2.00	270.00
01/27/2014	FLC	Draft report	4.00	540.00
01/28/2014	FLC	Draft report and telephone conference with Amy Weintrob	2.00	270.00
01/31/2014	FLC	Draft report	1.00	135.00
02/4/2014	FLC	Draft report	2.00	270.00
02/5/2014	FLC	Draft report	1.00	135.00
02/6/2014	FLC	Draft report	1.20	162.00
02/8/2014	FLC	Draft report	2.00	270.00
02/9/2014	FLC	Draft report	3.50	472.50
02/11/2014	FLC	Report draft	3.00	405.00
02/12/2014	FLC	Report draft	3.50	472.50
02/13/2014	FLC	Draft report	3.50	472.50
02/14/2014	FLC	Finalize report	3.00	405.00
02/17/2014	FLC	Telephone Conference with A. Weintrob	0.30	40.50
02/18/2014	FLC	Revise report, telephone conference with Amy Weintrob regarding same	2.00	270.00

City of Ventnor

Invoice #: 34390

Page

02/21/2014	FLC	Revise report	0.50	67.50
02/24/2014	FLC	Revise report, legal research [REDACTED]	1.00	135.00
02/25/2014	FLC	Finalize report and telephone conference with Ms. Weintrob, letter to Mr. Russo	1.50	202.50

For professional services rendered	102.10	\$13,783.50
N.J. State Sales Tax		\$0.00

Total amount of this bill **\$13,783.50**

Retainer applied \$0.00

Previous Balance \$0.00

Payments received since last invoice \$0.00

Balance Due **\$13,783.50**

*We accept Visa, Mastercard, Discover & American Express.
To make a payment by credit card, please contact our
Bookkeeper @ (609) 729-8298. Thank you.*

PLEASE INCLUDE THIS NUMBER ON YOUR CHECK >>> 6056-001

SUMMARY BY TIMEKEEPER

Timekeeper	Category	Rate	Hours	Amount
Frank Corrado Esq.	Senior Partner	\$135.00	102.10	\$13,783.50

